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[FS9 FSX P3D X-Plane] Navigraph AIRAC Cycle 1803. 18 MB: 30. In order
to use the corepack, you must first add "Driver=CORE" to the startup line

in the ini file of the game.Email NECC members discuss working
conditions during the Board of Directors meeting on Jan. 30, 2012, in
Truckee, Calif. By Kristen Taketa, Associated Press TRUCKEE, Calif. —
Three years after air traffic controllers at the Reno/Tahoe International

Airport went on strike, a union representing them wants to know what the
National Mediation Board has to say about what happened. In a legal
action filed Thursday, the National Air Traffic Controllers Association

requested the agency investigate whether the Reno/Tahoe International
Airport is a “unified work site.” That would mean the union would be able
to file a complaint with the board. The union contends Reno was an illegal
strike, arguing the airport was one unit but that the FAA hadn’t taken any
action. The union wants to know what all involved in the airport, from the

FAA to private contractors, did to ensure it was a single location for air
traffic control. Aircraft were grounded in Reno/Tahoe International Airport
in June 2011 as union members walked off the job. The NAMCRA cited a
series of incidents that affected the airport since the strike, including the
revocation of the staffs of six controllers, the change of the airport’s radio

frequency and a statement by the FAA that the strikers could not be
trusted to ensure safety. “All these things, taken together, you could

certainly describe as erratic,” said James Lyng, an attorney representing
NAMCRA. “We certainly think they have created a unified work site.”

NAMCRA previously went to the board when another air traffic controller
went on strike at the same airport in 2008. That action was dropped after

negotiations between the union and the airport broke down. In its
complaint, NAMCRA also cites a legal provision that would allow it to

reach an agreement with the airport regarding working conditions. It says
it’s willing to continue to bargain, but has not received an offer from the
airport. “They’re talking about dates, changing things, and they haven’t

said what kind of d0c515b9f4
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